
 

 

 

 

July 30, 2019 
By Electronic Mail and U.S. Postal Mail 

 
Scott Herczeg 
Century Century 
120 S. St. Jospeh Street 
South Bend, IN 46601 
scotth@southbendin.gov 
 
Re: Petition for Administrative Review –  IDHS Inspection Report Order Number AE7441 – 

Century Center (Civil Penalty) 
      
Dear Mr. Herczeg:  
 

The Commission is in receipt of your petition for administrarive review of IDHS Inspection Report 
Order Number AE7441 – Century Center (Civil Penalty), dated 7/25/2019. The petition for review is 
timely and has been granted by the Commission. The petition has been assigned to the Commission’s 
administrative law judge.   

 
The judge’s office will contact you to make arrangements for further proceedings. Should you 

have any questions, you may contact our staff attorney assigned to the matter, Justin Guedel at 
jguedel@dhs.in.gov or (317) 234-9515.  
 

Sincerely, 

 
Douglas J. Boyle, Director 
Fire Prevention and Building Safety Commission 
Indiana Department of Homeland Security 
302 W. Washington Street, Room E-208 
Indianapolis, IN 46204 
doboyle@dhs.in.gov 
(317) 650-7720  

 
 
Enclosure 
cc:  Justin Guedel, IDHS Staff Attorney (by personal service and electronic mail) 
 ALJ (by electronic mail) 

File 

mailto:jguedel@dhs.in.gov
mailto:doboyle@dhs.in.gov


From: DHS Legal Mailbox
To: Boyle, Douglas J (DHS)
Subject: FW: Petition for Review
Date: Friday, July 26, 2019 12:16:56 PM
Attachments: 68379161_Inspection Report.pdf

68380022_Century Center Koorsen Sprinkler repairs PO.PDF
68380035_Email Koosen.pdf
68380034_Work Order.pdf

 
 
From: noreply@formstack.com [mailto:noreply@formstack.com] 
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 5:17 PM
To: DHS Legal Mailbox <Legal@dhs.IN.gov>
Subject: Petition for Review
 
**** This is an EXTERNAL email. Exercise caution. DO NOT open attachments or
click links from unknown senders or unexpected email. ****

Formstack Submission For: petition for review 
Submitted at 07/25/19 5:16 PM

Individual Name: Scott Herczeg

Business Name: : Century Center

Phone Number: (574) 235-9711

Email Address: scotth@southbendin.gov

Mailing Address: 120 S. Dr. Martin Luther King Jr. Blvd.
South Bend, IN 46601

Are you represented
by an attorney?: No

Attorney Name:

Firm:

mailto:Legal@dhs.IN.gov
mailto:DoBoyle@dhs.IN.gov
https://soi.formstack.com/forms/petition_for_review
mailto:scotth@southbendin.gov




























 
 


 
TO: KOORSEN FIRE & SECURITY INC SHIP TO: MORRIS PERFORMING ART CTR 


 2719 N ARLINGTON AVE  MORRIS PERFORMING ART CTR 


 INDIANAPOLIS, IN 46218  211 N MICHIGAN STREET 


    SOUTH BEND, IN 46601 


      


 
REQUISITION # 0000221286 NOTICE TO VENDOR 


1. If Vendor delivers any merchandise without valid purchase order, no liability exists for City of South Bend  
 2. City of South Bend reserves right to cancel all or part of this order if delivery is not made when and as 
specified. 
 3. Vendor accepts this order at listed price or lowest prevailing market price. No price increase allowed after                                                                  
acceptance. 
 4. All goods subject to inspection and rejection (freight at vendor’s expense), not withstanding prior 
payments   to secure cash discount.. 
 5 If subject to cash discount, please indicate on invoice or claim.  


DELIVER BY DATE 05/29/2019 


ACCOUNT NO 67004066453106 


VENDOR’S NO 3481 


PROJECT NO   


REQUISITION DATE 05/29/2019   FEDERAL EXCISE TAX EXEMPTION              INDIANA SALES TAX EXEMPTION 
                       35-6001201                                                     0003502538-001 


ITEM # QUANTITY/UNIT ITEMS and DESCRIPTION Price Total 


 


This order issued in compliance with Chapter 99, Acts 1945 and acts 
amendatory thereof and supplemental thereto. 
 
I hereby certify there is an unobligated balance in this appropriation 
 sufficient to pay for this order.  


  
Controller or Authorized Representative                                                                           APPROVED – Central Purchasing Office 


                   PO. Number   252143 


THE ABOVE ORDER NUMBER 
MUST APPEAR ON ALL INVOICES, 
CLAIMS, PACKAGES, DELIVERY 
SLIPS, AND CORRESPONDENCE 


CITY OF SOUTH BEND 
 Accounts Payable -12 Floor County/City Building 
227 W. Jefferson Blvd. , South Bend, IN 46601 – Fax (574) 235-9928  
       The City of South Bend is an Equal Opportunity Employer 


 PURCHASE 


 ORDER    252143 


 


   
  
    1 


 


        


1.00 / EA    


REPLACE 1 3"OS&Y VALVE, 1 PRESSURE GAUGE &       


2,049.9600 


       


2,049.96 


            


    


waterflow switch  


 


  


 
 


 


 


        


 


  


 


 


 


 


 


TOTAL PURCHASE AMOUNT        $2,049.96 

















Phone Number:

Email Address:

Mailing Address:

Order Number: 7441

Facility | Device |
Boiler ID:

Date Order Received: Jun 11, 2019

How did you receive
the Order? : Hand Delivery

Entity Issuing Order: Fire Prevention and Building Safety Commission

Entity Name:

Upload Order: View File

Was this order
specifically directed to
you?:

Yes

Explain:

I was given a Civil Penalty for not having corrective
action done on Fire Sprinkler System. I had a PO, the
work was scheduled and Koorsen showed up to do the
work without parts and then no showed. They had 40
days to do this work and it should have been completed
before re-inspection. They have acknowledged it was
their fault and agreed to credit me the fine amount.

Have you been
aggrieved or adversely
affected by the order?:

Yes

Explain:

I was made to feel like I wasn't telling the truth about the
service providers commitment, I did what I was supposed
to do and got the PO, the service provider not doing what
they were supposed to wasn't my fault.

If the order was not
specifically directed to
you and you have not

https://s3.amazonaws.com/files.formstack.com/uploads/3179105/68379161/523339752/68379161_inspection_report.pdf


been aggrieved or
adversely affected by
the order, are you
entitled to review
under some other law?
:

No

What law?:

I request review of the
entire order described
above:

Yes

If you are not
requesting review of
the entire order, what
is the scope of your
request?:

I request a stay of
effectiveness:

What is the basis of
your challenge? :

What is your desired
outcome? :

I want the fined waived, I did what I was supposed to do ,
the unresponsive service provider not doing what they
were supposed to do is not my fault.

Additional
information in support
of my request:

I'm attaching the PO and the email where Koorsen admits
fault and the work order that shows the work got done.

Additional
Attachments: View File

Additional
Attachments: View File

Additional
Attachments: View File

Copyright © 2019 Formstack, LLC. All rights reserved. This is a customer service email.

Formstack, 11671 Lantern Road, Suite 300, Fishers, IN 46038

https://s3.amazonaws.com/files.formstack.com/uploads/3179105/68380022/523339752/68380022_century_center_koorsen_sprinkler_repairs_po.pdf
https://s3.amazonaws.com/files.formstack.com/uploads/3179105/68380035/523339752/68380035_email_koosen.pdf
https://s3.amazonaws.com/files.formstack.com/uploads/3179105/68380034/523339752/68380034_work_order.pdf














 
 

 
TO: KOORSEN FIRE & SECURITY INC SHIP TO: MORRIS PERFORMING ART CTR 

 2719 N ARLINGTON AVE  MORRIS PERFORMING ART CTR 

 INDIANAPOLIS, IN 46218  211 N MICHIGAN STREET 

    SOUTH BEND, IN 46601 

      

 
REQUISITION # 0000221286 NOTICE TO VENDOR 

1. If Vendor delivers any merchandise without valid purchase order, no liability exists for City of South Bend  
 2. City of South Bend reserves right to cancel all or part of this order if delivery is not made when and as 
specified. 
 3. Vendor accepts this order at listed price or lowest prevailing market price. No price increase allowed after                                                                  
acceptance. 
 4. All goods subject to inspection and rejection (freight at vendor’s expense), not withstanding prior 
payments   to secure cash discount.. 
 5 If subject to cash discount, please indicate on invoice or claim.  

DELIVER BY DATE 05/29/2019 

ACCOUNT NO 67004066453106 

VENDOR’S NO 3481 

PROJECT NO   

REQUISITION DATE 05/29/2019   FEDERAL EXCISE TAX EXEMPTION              INDIANA SALES TAX EXEMPTION 
                       35-6001201                                                     0003502538-001 

ITEM # QUANTITY/UNIT ITEMS and DESCRIPTION Price Total 

 

This order issued in compliance with Chapter 99, Acts 1945 and acts 
amendatory thereof and supplemental thereto. 
 
I hereby certify there is an unobligated balance in this appropriation 
 sufficient to pay for this order.  

  
Controller or Authorized Representative                                                                           APPROVED – Central Purchasing Office 

                   PO. Number   252143 

THE ABOVE ORDER NUMBER 
MUST APPEAR ON ALL INVOICES, 
CLAIMS, PACKAGES, DELIVERY 
SLIPS, AND CORRESPONDENCE 

CITY OF SOUTH BEND 
 Accounts Payable -12 Floor County/City Building 
227 W. Jefferson Blvd. , South Bend, IN 46601 – Fax (574) 235-9928  
       The City of South Bend is an Equal Opportunity Employer 

 PURCHASE 

 ORDER    252143 

 

   
  
    1 

 

        

1.00 / EA    

REPLACE 1 3"OS&Y VALVE, 1 PRESSURE GAUGE &       

2,049.9600 

       

2,049.96 

            

    

waterflow switch  

 

  

 
 

 

 

        

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

TOTAL PURCHASE AMOUNT        $2,049.96 
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